T HE—71 goltver w&—UA/DO/DDN/30/2024-2026

TPBIY T Gi7elTos

STNNEGvS BN gIRT YRR
STHTIENINoT

faemdt aRkf¥rse

-2, €U (&)
(STNrETE TS I)

QENUGA, YHAR, 25 TFeIls, 2025 S0

19Ul 03, 1947 IH WHET

SESNECRSRIINES
furh vad wadn e fawmr
WE&AT 259 / XXXVI (3) /2025 /36(1) / 2025
QEUG, 25 S, 2025

iferET
fafaer

e —

"IN BT HAYF @ IEeE 213 @ @ (1) & A Hio USgure T WA
arRe wfear, SwRmEvs (FelwE) sy, 2025° TEnfig fhar & alv g
STNTEUS 9T ET SLATGY W&l 03 q9-2025 & WI H Ad—WERY & qae
$9 SIERTEAT g7 vl fhar S €



2 SATETS IR Tole, 25 ellg, 2025 $0 (5G9 03, 1947 & W)

WA RS wfedn, STRrave (e ey 2025
(STEvS SRy WEm— 03, ¥ 2025)

(wnw%%aﬁﬂ#wmmmﬁﬁ)

| Wi AR @R, STRIETS, 2024 (AfSfrm Hem—o3 af, 2024)
EPRGHICE R B

i, X @ Qe war w2 F 7§ ek wowere @ g wwe 8 w2
ﬁfﬁ%ﬂqﬁﬁaﬁaﬁﬁmwaﬁmﬁwwﬁmﬂmmawma

Tl 8

IqegTS YT

&

STACH, 314, WIogUlel IRA & WidaE & sreoe 213 @ @Wus (1) g yEe
wfaerdl @1 W P4 g0 MR sty e e i

it |7 afte
BT

YR 7 &7 FHIed

NI 10 T TINE

YRT 11 6T e

(1) 59 cracy @ W@Rw 9 wue ArRe
e, SRRMEve (Fele) 3y, 2025 2

(2) I% I Hgwl B

WA ArIRG Wiedr SwwrEes, 2024 (R R
AN Hel Wedr wHE T 2) @ ¥R 7 A
QuegrT (1) @ fadfa wge § ww ww =t @
W W UP q¥ wew @ &Y @i

He fEer H, gmr 10 H—

(i) SwmT (2) 4 ‘B W@ TR & WH W
S T W v R wm,

(11) SWRT (3) % ‘B "WE ULl $ WHE W
T a6 veE W Ry S |

e wigem ¥, awr 11 #-

(i) Swar (3) 4 'Bg WE Wl & WM W
T T wee W el W

(ii) YRI (4) %, 'BF WE YW & WM W®
TH A el X fad SR

o W Hla Rig,
qrdtgaes, garg ey,
wdirayy, drewey (3@ fa)
XTI, IwiNIdos |

3TSIT 9,

Ao Agdal,
e fa |



STRIEUS 3MIERYT TolE, 25 Geg, 2025 30 (1997 03, 1947 S Weaw) 3

No. 259/XXXVI(3)/2025/36(1)/2025
Dated Dehradun, July 25, 2025

NOTIFICATION

Miscellaneous

In pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3) of Article 348 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
following English translation of ‘The - Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand

(Amendment) Ordinance, 2025 (Uttarakhand Ordinance No. 03 of 2025).

As promulgated by the Governor on 24 July, 2025.

The Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand (Amendment) Ordinance, 2025
[Uttarakhand Ordinance No. 03 Year, 2025]

(Promulgated by the Governor in the Seventy-sixth Year of the Republic of India)
An
Ordinance

further to amend the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024 (Act No. 03 of the
year, 2024),

Whereas, the Legislative Assembly of the State 1s not in session and the Governor .
is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate
action; ;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article 213 of ;
the Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to promulgate the following
Ordinances:- '

Short title and 1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Uniform Civil Code,
commencement Uttarakhand (Amendment) Ordinance, 20235,

(2) It shall come into force al once.
Amendment of 2. In section 7 of the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024
section 7 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Code), in the second
proviso to the sub-section (1), for the words 'six months', the
words 'one yeat' shall be substituted.



STRIEYS SMIERT TO(E, 25 S[ellg, 2025 30 (14T 03, 1947 ¥H Wraw)

Amendment of 3,

section 10

Amendment of 4.

section 11

In the principal Code, in section 10,-

(1) in sub-section (2), for the words “six months’, the words
‘one year' shall be substituted:;

(i1) in sub-section (3), for (he words “six months’, the words
'one year' shall be substituted.
In the principal Code, in section 11.,-

(i) in sub-section (3), for the words *six months’, the words
‘one year' shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (4), for the words ‘six months’, the words
‘one year' shall be substituted.

LT GEN GURMIT SINGH,
PVSM, UYSM, AVSM, VSM (Retd)
Governor, Uttarakhand.

By Order,

DHANANJAY CHATURVED!,

Principal Secretary.

dlovwogo (smrogo) 17 / fwmY / 330—2025— 1004500 Hfyaf (Frogew /Hf)



