HH HEqT—23 SOl e UADO/DDNS06M 2028

ANT—1, Vg (@)
(evres arftifPrm)

SENIG, WANAR, 07 s, 2026 20
A4 17, 1948 TP WY
NTNTEES i
e 101/ XXXVI (3) /2028 /32(1) / 2028
Regs, 07 i, 2028

aifRrE=
fafeer

——

" NS @ SR @ argesT 200 & i wEmiE yowa 4 Saweve R
W BT iR W AiRE Siean, sweve (W) R, 20260 w R
08 I, 2026 W A ST W S 4R wewravs @ Al den oz, @l 202 @
R =R & et s st @R awfn @ o &



STNTE"S FHERT e, 07 aftel, 2026 Fo (37 17, 1948 v ww)

W ARG wfew, Somve (WEeE) i, 2026

(ewvreEvs wfdfraw dew— o2, @ 202s)

WA SR Siew, SRS, 2024 (Saievs iy wea-03 W, 2024)

¥ e weiE e o B
e
AT ST @ Faeas 99 ¥ Swowts Rum—tes G e e i
g e g
WS [ | (1) 5% olieae o1 GEw AW W Anis |
iR VR TwEve (HeiEE) i, 2026 B |I
() = e s g |
i A 2, A iR S, Saaes, 2004 (o & A
e o W ww T 4) 0 e whew R o
(EifiEs dew o2 of o) o o5 W AR @
R Y, WE-wE 96 an © “WRGE NG IR
wiem, 2022 (s@fem W 48, T 2023)° i, ai?sl
o Tors v R Wl
7w 3. el Wi B4R 7 %, S (1) @ BoE avas T,
HhE 'W_ﬁﬁ'ﬂﬁﬁ?ﬂﬂ?ﬁ'wﬂ#'mﬁrm
S|
HRT 10 &1 4. | 5 Wiew % ST 10 -
L (yeww @) 3 v T TR B WM R E A
oo v fow W
(i) s (3) ¥ “vE A ww @ wWw W W
o T e S |
RNT | 5. | g e §, o 11 N—
ERIb _ . |
(i) o (@) #, “Ow W e ® we oW e el
v v Rl




TTRIETE UM T, 07 s, 2026 0 (83 17, 1048 W ww)

|

(i) s=7a (1) % "ox Wy ww B wWH R T
w8 e v B e |
A W o 9 12 o wwEw (1) § ww wna @

TRl 12 = 6.

RSk Wi 9 ne e e @ B st

RTS8 W™ | 7. TR IR ¥ W 13 @ e (3) o e TR

T & Taan sl sisie—
ait Su-Fegw. oEw () § fEina wEwco
T® T ¥ Rew ww & @ oW Ra
Rrers-eds o o @ orgow wrer S Ao &L
R & Rae @ W SR 8 onen o
arg e Peife sl ool o ¥ Rew
T © T IS © T I S e .

W W | 8. | gl wiew @Y 5 47 B 9 @) & -

e "N WIE U O eward a9 e s @e e il
TR T EE W TS @ A BT SR © N 6
WA iR, 2008 EReET W 45, a9 2028) ¥
e mOE B SR Tvedm B WEL o afiv
fore e R wmE |

e 10 wi| & | o an ol e 19 A Fee ) avs” oE 9 RN TN

i TR T W R

W@ 10. | 5w wiw @ O 1@ © qvow Rrenene o

0T strenfin we & m, amio—

SR "o, W-ege W UiRkG aiREw @ Rvg afiv-

AR DY WD, Sl v why 9 ) |

(1) wisi w19 @ s S-Fidvw W wie oRRRG
o B, ug ow o Raw 9 ex wew e
st W ot ReE @ e ol e
oY W | '

(2) wwemT (1) & @ida & 7 adle, TRg aEw W
i ol & we, Gk wee ol A 8 ww
s, S R wow wwR g el B ong )
(3) eriwie Wi, ¥ ardm @ g wwaRw Al




SEITEYS AWERT e, o7 aita, 2026 fo (#3117, 1948 % W)

S A% @ | IL | v wiET @ 2 &% wgmr (1) -
e (i) @z (@) % "1 Rre & v w9 W AR
- g v R Wi
(ii) @vs (@) & geam Prfoiien @ve smenim %
e ik, apre—
(@) fr Ree & o Raw @ Rd @ wm S
IO e @ R W fear g Regr 8T
W25 W | 12, | % s & uN-2s 91 9w () ® @R () @
W vy wReen @ R wem, SwRiRE-
“(i) "Ry Fiore & ergonT/SFETT © W] aome,
v, S S T g 4 R g
S B TN 13, | v wiem w5t uw 28 % we, ol SiX o W (2)
e % we (i) ofic ()" @ Wm ™ e, sfe siv e e
ouaT (2) o wEE (3)" wiveta oy BY S
e 32 BT 14, “*ﬁmﬁ'ﬂﬂﬁtﬁﬁﬁwﬁ}ﬁmﬁﬂﬁﬁﬁ
e X W T, Sl
(1) w5 i =i W

() Foreem 9 = = ohien §, Witar ® st 3 B
TR B 4 © @& () T SoueT oW §Y fowr
@ foos o & W 93 YRa@ @ Sinal, 2028
(@ifay e 46w 2020) @ I e W Wit
i,

(i) & 4 & @5 (i) = eowe o1 Gus wa & )
(iftiPras wien 6, 95 2007) & 3RT0 GvsAE B
(i) =0 4 @ @9 (V) ® Soe o Raw o O
@O & U G NE T & e wwa e T
WWWHWWW?%WW
T, W @ WE 99 RiaRa fo on W 8 @
58 W AR 8,




SRS SRR TwE, 07 atd, 2026 go (W3 17, 1948 e wr)

(v) o 20 % e % few Pl s § | A
of trw & i O wve o g o Wi e

(v) Roeli =it @ gafters ¥ o5e o 30 @ UEIRT
) % Bl fh N o © srgoy R T @ (Y
Raw, geifa @ ofniRe e & o5 &= af ™ 9
SR B HREE G0 UG W Wil 5o o e AR
T 5 & 0 B 4 U0 @ ARiRes e $ 98
Bl Wl B

(i) 7 T W oEEd & wean O B @i N
aE & o wewe W o0 S 9F o o oo o
e W avea e waw SR g B 0
(vil) Riare & fom enedl weom, e Ry o fowm
§ @ Tow S W 8, O ove a% g W
g Wiewm, 2023 Qe wew 45 9d p023) @
i wosa wEm |

SIVRT 43 @ 15, | am wfeen o 0w 43 ¥ wwwn (1) o o ¥, ey

SRR oA WS SEEIY W onmie Wia g Wl B
W W EeE wwe (@), (@) M F s
Frgone s e e ol v e R o

BN 386 Wi - | 16, | e Wisw | 4N a4 @ ol ¥ Feieien e v Be
g Feifa s 8§ wend Wi wme 2R oW
WETO—T3 G TNl |

SToses W] 17, | v WivCH Wi 6 985 W

() v (1) % W oeant Tl @ we ™ W
SR T R e

(i) ST (2) w1 S T Ry

(i) wwemr () % S wEa” we @ WF W e
TeanaEl T v B W




SURTETS ST Toie, o7 snta, 2006 go (45 17, 1948 9% W)

oW 967 o
R

18.

| S W W S W s e 8

ECTERT )
320% T
360 T

19.

W Wfew o1 W ser ¥ wwew (3) © wWAm
Freieritn soemn st we & o, auif-

(o) af% v =fs W U@ @ SewEw G e
i B TEEe W e e see Wil T w8
vl 9% WA 9, e Ui oW s oW B w6,
drea o e Jf 5l e o @l S

B) s w1 W g se0 o wwEE () ® v F
TR eY % o § o win o T @ onee o
wien fisen @ w0 98 SR @ o e s

W I STEm B oE oaw b Rl =i =
T B S G Se o ue % oW 8t
o R el @ e ¥ ouw of o o o
I W 9 T B

) & o v =R uw s @ o @) B
TreE X Rl e & e weadh Wi ¥ v &
T O9F O 0 @ RS o o e S o

T Ao IR, O W AR oo Rranea B o
woa & W siten Fae w a7

T OWRT oA 90 @ wwER e s
e e W s, i
"50, Wi R T @ ko _
st Rt Gl B Pree we o I o 2 W
siwfa g TR o el G e @
Pt B ot & o e g AT @ SR
W oI ST e W |

S50, TT W TR

o WiRw © wade) @ oiety oAt e B W TR
SR & qer o wily dgar 5 ew @ )
T 0 P g Riais wivar @ sgem age o
W




NORTEIVS SRR e, 07 dild, 2026 f0 (A7 17, 1948 wiE )

T wew ¥ aggd-a & feier & o owEms W

FFga-2 = 20.

wEE T B & owm w sR/oEr T o
WA |

e el 21, | () T e wow, SaEve (GwlienT) SRR,

ke 2026 (emArS® SEw-0n, @9 2026) WRENI R

Torem = B

@) ¥ Freww & IR 57 0 e awmRw @ oEe o
T W A @ oran 56 aitBey o vl sul
= el 9 nd il wEe

;TS A,

JRfE= R,
3R wiad |



STRTEE 3RMRY Twe. 07 sild, 2026 Zo (334 17, 1048 vrw )

TS T SR o wA

R iR, aweews, 202 (wRifEe e s, ¢ 2024) B

nﬁw%m wiie P § g s, R Roower W ST gl

e Rt stfvrsiol @) e ¥ v gy wiger g WEEEl S SOEE

qﬁﬁ%ﬁ%ﬂ%ﬂ?ﬁmwmﬁ}&mr.mmm
o |

02— Wit Rtuw G sy @ vk Rivas & e owies 9
@l i e g

geer 7E i
A |



Wmm,nraiﬁ.zuu#n(ﬂaﬂmewcu 9

No. 101/ XXX VI(3)2026/32(1)/2025
Dated Dehradun, April 07, 2026

MNOTIFICATION
Miscellangous

In pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3) of Article 348 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
following English translation of *The Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand
(Amendment) Act, 2026° (Adhiniyam Sankhya 02, of 2026)

As passed by the Unsrakliand Legtslative Assemble and assemed to
by the Governor on 06 April. 2026.

THE UNIFORM CIVIL CODE, UTTARAKHAND (AMENDMENT)
ACT, 2026
[Uttarakhand Act No. 02 Year 2026]
AN
ACT
s fusther to amend the Uniform Civil Code, Utizrakhand, 2024 (Act No. 03 of

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Uttarakhand in the Seventy-seventh
Year of the Republic of Tndia as follows:-

Short tilleand | 1. [(1) This Act may be called the Uniform Civil Code,
commencement Ustaralchand (Amendment) Act, 2026.

(2) Itshall coms inlo force al once.

Amendment In 2. | In the Uniform Civil Code, Uttaralkhand, 2024 (hereinafter
Code referred to as the principal Code) for the words, figures
and signs “Criminal Procedure Code, 1973 (Act o 2 year |
1974)", wherever they oceur, the words, figures and signs
“Qharative Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (Act No. 46
0f 2023)" siall be substituted, |




10

CSTRIETS AR TN, 07 ante, zozs g0 (4 17 1948 515 ¥we)

In section 7 of the principsal Cods, in the second proviso of

Ammendment ol 3.

section 7 the sub-seckion (1), for the words “six months", the words
“one year” shall be substituted.

Amendvent of | 4. | In the principal Code, in section 10,-

spatinh £ (i) . subssoction (2); for the words Ysix months®, the
words “one year” shall be substitutzd;
(ii) in sub-section (3), for the words “six months", the
words “one year” shall be substitutad.

Amendment of | 5. | In the principal Code, in section 11~

seetian 11 (i) in sub-ssetion (3), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year” shall be substituted;
(ii) in sub-section (4), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year" shall be substituied.

Amendmentof | 6. |lIn sub-section (1) of section 12 of the principal Code, for|

seciion12 the word “Secretary”, the words “Additional Secretary”
shall be substituted. B

Amendmealol | 7. |In the principal Code, sub-section (3) of Section 13 shall

sertion 13 be substitited a3 follows, namely:—

“IF the Sub-Registear fails to take action within the time
period prescribed under sub-ssction (2), the mariage,
divorce or declaration of nullity of marriags, a5 the case
may be, shall automatically get forwarded to the Registrar,
and if the Registrar fails to tske action within the
prescribed time period, it shall get forwarded (o the
Registrar general.™.

ﬁmr_mﬂmwﬂ of 2. |In sub-section (2) of section 17 of the prineipal Cods, for
Sciany the words “shall be punishable with imprisonment for a
term which may exiend to three months, or with fine not
exeeeding twenty-five thousand rupees, or with both™, the
words, figures and signs “shall be punishable according o
tiee provisions contzined in the Bharatiya Nyaye Sanhite,
2023 (Act No. 45 of 2023)" shall be substituted.
Amendment of | 9. | In section 19 of the principal Code, in the hieading, for the
section 19 word “pumishment”, the word “penshy” shall be

substituted.




STEYS SMrETeT Te, o7 anle, 2026 0 (99 17, 1948 W W) "

Imsergiom of mew r 10,

gection 19 A

{3) The appellate authority may, confinm, modify or annul | -

After szction 19 of the principal Code, following section

shell be inserted, namely—

“19A. Appeal ageinst penally impesed om Sub-

Registrar-

(1) Where a penaliy has bean imposed on & Sub-Registrar
under section 19, he may prefer an appeel within
thirty days befors the competent appeliate authority
as notified by the State Government,

(2) An appeal under sub-section (1) shaell be preseated
slong with certified copy of the order of penally in
the prescribed form and manner, 25 determined by the
State Government.

such order as it deems nscessary.”.

e —

: Amendment of
seciiom 24

11,

‘In sub-section (1) of section 24 of the principal Code,-

(i) in clause (d) for the sign “ , the *; or” sign and word ‘f
shall be substituted:

(ii) after clavse (d), the following clsuse shail be inseried
as follows, namsly:-

“(w) that ai the time of the marriage one of the partiss to

the marrigge had misrepresented hisfher identity.”.

Amendment of
section 25

In the principal Code, clause (Wofab?scctiun (3) of
section 25 shall be substituted as follows, namely-

“(i) the husband hss, since the solemnization/
conirzcting of the marriage, indulged in rape, anal sex,
bestiality or necrophiliae sexual intercourse; o

Amendment of
seetion 16

13.

In section 26 of the principel Code afier words, figures
and signs “clausss (i) and (i) of sub-section (2)", the
words, figures and signs “sub-section (2) and sub-section
(3)" shall be subssituted.

Amendment of |
eeeliom 3%

In the principal Code, sub-section (1) of section 32 shall
be substituted as follows, namely—
“(1) Any person who-
(i) having & husband or wife is living, marriage another
person afier the commencement of the Code in
contravention of clause (i) of section 4, shall be




12 SRS ST e, 07 Al 2026 Fo (@5 17, 1948 T wrq)

punishable under the Bharatiya Nyaya Sanhits,

2023 (ActNo. 45 0f2023);

(ii) contracis 2 marriage in confravention of clanse (fii)
of section 4, such act shall be punishable under the

Prohibition of Child Mavrisge Act, 2006 (Act No.
6 of 2007); _

(iii) procures a marriage in contravention of clause (iv)
of section 4 shall be punishable with simple
imprisonment for a term which may extend to six
months and with fine not exceeding rupees Ry
thousand, end in default of fine, to undergo further
imprisonment for a term which may exiend o one
manth;

(iv) clissolves a marringe in contravention of section 29
shall be punishable with imprisonmeat for a lerm
which may extend to three years and shall also he
lisble to fins;

(v) compels, abets or induces a person to observe any
condition as is referred to in sub-section (2) of
section 30 before remarviage shell be publishable
with imprisonment for a term which may extend (o
three yesrs and shall zlso be liable to fine of rupess
ane laith, and in default of fine, to undergo firher
imprisonrnent for a term which may extend fo six
months;

(vi) obtains the consent of & person for marriage by
force, coercion or freud shall be punisheble with
imprisoament for a term which may extend to
seven years and shell also be liable to fine;

(vii) procured the consent for marriags through
misrepreseniation or concealment of facts then
such aci shall be punishable under “the Bharaiiya
Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (Act No. 45 of 2023).”.

Amendment of | 15, | In ssction 43 of the principal Code, et the end of in sub.
sestion 43 section (1), for the words “the Court shall decree siich'
' relief accordingly.”, the words and sign “the Court shall
granl relief in accordance with clauses (2), (b) and (c)"
shall be substitated. |
Amendment of | 16. |In the principal Code af the end of section 384, the
section 384 following words and sign shall be added, namely-




UTTRIEYS SRENTT e, 07 @ie, 2026 o (45 17, 1948 Ww )

|

[
“In such cases, the regisirar shall issus a certificate

regarding termingtion of ths live-in relationship to both

the pariners; in & formal prescribed by the Stais

GovernmenL.”.

Amendimentof | 17.
section 335

In section 385 of the principal Cods.-

(i) i sub-gection (1), for the words and sign "such
partnez(s)”, the words "those parlners” shall be
substituted;

(ii) sub-section (2) has been omitted;

(iii) in sub-seetion (3), for the words and sign "guch
pariner(s)", the weords "those pasriners” shall be
substituted,

Amendment of | 18.

section 387

In section 387 of the principal Code, after sub-section (3),

the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely-

“(4) Whoever obtaing the consent of any person by
fores, eoercion or fraud to establish a live-in relationship
shall be punishable with imprisonment for 2 term which
may extend io seven years and shall also be liable to fine.
(5) Whoever stays in a live-in relationship in
contravention of sub-seclion (2) of section 380 shall be
punishable with imprisonment for a term which may
extend (o seven years and shall also ba liable to fine:

Provided that, nothing in this sub-ssction shall

apply to a pewson who has terminated the live-in
celationship or whose partner has not been heard of for a
period of seven years or more.
(6) Any major person who lives in 2 live-in relationship
with minor in contravention of sub-section (3) of section
380 shall be punishable with simple imprisonment for a
term which may exiend to six months and with fine which
may exiend to fifty thousand rupess; and in default of
peyment of such fine, with further imprisonment which
may extend to onz month,”,

[nsertion of new | 10,
sectlons 3904
and 3208

In the principal code after section 390 the following

sections shall bs insected, namely:—
“390A. Power to cance! regisiration-

The power to cancel any registration relating o
marriags, divorce, live-in refationship or suceession shall

lie with the Registrar General appointed under Section 12.




L STNTETS SR W, 07 anla, 2026 €0 (95 17, 1948 ww )

Before the cancelling such registration, the applicant shell
be given opportunity of being heard by the Registrar
General, .
3B, Recovery of peualiy-

Any penalty imposed under the provisions of this
Code shall be recovered like arrears of land revenus or in
such menner s mey be specified by rules made under this
Codz.”,

Amendment of | 20. | In the principal Code, in serial numbsr 3 of Class-1 of

Schedule-2 Schedule-2, for the word “Widow", the word “Spouse”
| shall be substituted.

ﬁ“w anil 2L | (1) The Uniform Civil Cods, Utteralthand (Amendment)

svitigs Ordinance, 2026 (Qrdinance No. 02 of 2026) is herchy

repealed.

(2) Woiwithetanding such repeal, enything done of any
action talcen under e said Ordinance shall desmed (o
have besn done or tsken under the comesponding

provisions of this Act |

By Order,

ARVIND KUMAR,
Addtional Secretary,




SURTATS IGIER TE, 07w, 2026 fo (@7 17, 1848 ww waw) 15

STATEMENT OF QBIECTS AND REASONS

Afier the enforcement of the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024 (Act No. 03
of 2024), for amending the certain provisions of the Code in light of the expericnce
gamed during iis implementation, suggestions received From verious staleholdss, ind
emerging legal requirements the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand (Amendment)
Ovdinancs, 2026 was promulgsaisd,

2-  The proposed Bill is the replacing Bill of said Ordinance and fulfills the aforesaid
objectives.

Pushlkar Singlh Diami
Chiel Minister.

Howwoge (mwogo) os / Faurdt /e3—2026—1004+500 whvaT (megeEs 2 afvml)



